



TOYOHARI FOUNDATION Program 

APPLICATION


Name:


Address:


Telephone:


Email Address:


Address: 


I will undertake the Program in:


Brisbane, Australia


Christchurch, New Zealand


Melbourne, Australia


Sydney, Australia 

AHPRA No. if applicable:


Acupuncture Qualifications: (please include Program, educational institution and 
year of graduation).


*Please attach a copy of your most recent acupuncture qualification (e.g. Bache-
lor degree or Master’s degree).


TUITION POLICY 

The Toyohari Foundation Program is a 21 day commitment. The Program is an 
integrated syllabus and as such absence from any of the sessions will significant-
ly impact on the required competencies. 




TOYOHARI FOUNDATION Program APPLICATION


If you have enrolled in the Program, and your absence is unavoidable it is your 
(the student’s) responsibility to cover the material in your own time. The Pro-
gram may not be deemed to have been successfully completed if there is more 
than two days of absences. Exceptional circumstances will be considered on a 
case-by case basis by the Academic Dean.


Alternatively, you may complete a missed portion of the Program at another 
Toyohari Foundation Program. Please be aware however, that another Program 
may not run in the following or subsequent years. If you select this option, you 
will not graduate until the missed portion of the Program has been completed 
and you will not be eligible to become a practicing member of the Australasian 
Branch of the Toyohari Association until the Program has been fully completed. 


CANCELLATION POLICY


The Australasian Branch of the Toyohari Association has the right to cancel the 
program if numbers are insufficient, in this case a full refund will be given.


REFUNDS


A full refund minus transaction fees will be issued until 1 July 2023 if requested 
in writing.


A 50% refund will be offered until 1 September 2023 if requested in writing.


After 1 September 2023, no refund will be made as this may make the Program 
unviable.


Toyohari has the right to cancel the Program, if numbers are insufficient. In this 
case a full refund will be given.


PAYMENT METHODS


A Registration Fee of $500 is the minimum required to register for the Program. 


The fee for the entire Program  (minus the Registration Fee) is $4590 plus GST = 
$5049.
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PAYMENT


Choose Your Payment Option (please tick) 

I have paid the Registration fee of $500 and will pay the remainder of the 
full Program fee by 1 September 2023.  

I have paid the Registration fee of $500 and will pay the remainder in 4 in-
stalments of  $1,137.25, to be completed by 1 September 2023.


DECLARATION


I have read and agree to the Tuition Policy and the Cancellation Policy.


I have attached copies of relevant educational qualifications.


_________________________________		 ___________________________ 
signature 	 	 	 	 	 date


Email your completed application to toyohariaustralasia@gmail.com

Direct Deposit


Account Name: ABTA 
BSB: 032-023 
Acc: 252063 
Please use your full name as reference. 

Payment Plan

Four instalments $1,137.25, The full Program fee is required by 1 September 
2023 to commence the Program. 

Please contact: treasurer@toyohari.org.au to arrange a payment plan. 
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